PROPERTIES OFFERED AT 2017 TAX SALE

PARCEL NAME CERT TAX+COST SALE AMT SURPLUS|BIDDER NAME # POST SALE ACTIVITY
88-13-23-425-032 [123 ENTERPRISES INC no bid $639.98 $0.00 $0.00

88-12-07-310-054 |ABOVE PAR INV LLC 17001 $5,117.62 $5,117.62 $0.00|LEXINGTON INVESTMENT INC/HOSMER, WILLIAM CRAIG(AGENT) 2017.031
88-12-07-310-009 |ABOVE PAR INV LLC no bid $1,801.32 $0.00 $0.00

88-13-04-401-179 |ADAMS, LESLIES no bid $411.32 $0.00 $0.00

88-13-04-401-063 |ADAMS, LESLIES no bid $522.19 $0.00 $0.00

88-13-11-422-018 |BAKER, CYNTHIA LOU 17002 $1,183.11 $3,700.00 $2,516.89|BARE HOMES LLC / BARE, BRANDON 2017.027
88-13-14-417-027 |BARNES, CHRISTOPHER JAMES no bid $3,533.93 $0.00 $0.00

88-13-11-307-011 |BOHMONT, LENNA no bid $1,831.96 $0.00 $0.00

88-18-11-213-009 |BROWNLOW, JOHN R 17003 $3,365.57 $47,000.00] $43,634.43|ALDEN, EDWIN D 2017.002
88-13-15-402-003 |CASTON, TRACY L ETAL no bid $522.19 $0.00 $0.00

88-13-15-218-039 |COMPTON, GUS SR no bid $1,403.60 $0.00 $0.00

88-02-29-300-061 |CORTESE, JOSEPH 17004 $728.76 $728.76 $0.00|LEXINGTON INVESTMENT INC/HOSMER, WILLIAM CRAIG(AGENT) 2017.031
88-13-02-311-064 |CRABTREE, MARK 17005 $2,268.37 $16,100.00]  $13,831.63|ROSALES, MARIA R 2017.012
88-13-14-434-020 |DECKARD, EDNA MAY ETAL no bid $1,803.88 $0.00 $0.00

88-13-21-405-034 |DEVINE, JIM ETAL 17006 $2,501.98 $2,501.98 $0.00{JOHNSON, LEAH 2017.029
88-13-21-122-003 |ELM STREET RESQLUTION LLC 17007 $522.19 $522.19 $0.00|MATHIS, MICHAEL J 2017.034
88-13-02-301-028 |EVANS, MYRLH 17008 $1,015.28 $4,800.00 $3,784.72|LAKES LLC/HALL, KEVIN(AGENT) 2017.018
88-18-08-300-108 |FF/M REAL EST INV LLC no bid $58,804.40 $0.00 $0.00

88-18-08-300-115 |FF/M REALEST INV LLC no bid $91,108.52 $0.00 $0.00

88-18-08-300-116 |FF/M REAL EST INV LLC no bid $79,168.88 $0.00 $0.00

88-18-08-300-107 |FF/M REALEST INV LLC no bid $53,664.44 $0.00 $0.00

88-18-08-300-117 |FF/M REALEST INV LLC no bid| $292,992.31 $0.00 $0.00

88-19-05-413-019 |FIELDER STINE ENTERPRIZES INC no bid $1,136.19 $0.00 $0.00

88-13-11-404-034 |FINNEY, LISA R no bid $2,518.98 $0.00 $0.00

88-13-12-222-003 |GILLIS, DAVID no bid $1,231.48 $0.00 $0.00

88-12-08-412-024 |GOINS, JASON W ETAL 17009 $1,525.87 $15,100.00|  $13,574.13|KARAS, ANTONINA 2017.001
88-18-19-100-279 |HANCOCK, GENEW no bid $549.86 $0.00 $0.00

88-09-18-400-004 |HARRELL, OPAL L 17010 $1,549.83 $30,000.00|  $28,450.17|NKA LLC/NEWBERRY, DAN(AGENT) 2017.023
88-13-15-413-006 |HICKS, LESTER M 17011 $843.18 $1,300.00 $456.82|FIELDS, STERLING W |1l 2017.035
88-13-28-201-040 |HOPPIS, ARGIE 17012 $300.44 $300.44 $0.00|ROSALES, MARIA R 2017.012
88-07-04-300-005 |JOHNSON, JOE 17013 $785.30 $1,650.00 $864.70|CREATIVE INVESTMENT OPPORTUNITIES, INC/FERRIL, GLEN H 2017.005
88-13-28-201-007 |JUSTICE, GOLDIE M 17014 $1,539.05 $2,600.00 $1,060.95|S&C GROUP LLC / NELSON, CINDY 2017.021
88-12-28-201-263 |KEITH, LISAM 17015 $247.90 $247.90 $0.00|ROSALES, MARIA R 2017.012
88-13-03-218-007 |KOENIG, MILDRED ETAL no bid $459.33 $0.00 $0.00

88-12-21-302-022 |KRITCH, MICHAEL G no bid $494.86 $0.00 $0.00

88-18-11-308-024 |LONEY, JUDY C 17016 $3,022.72 $59,000.00]  $55,977.28|ALDEN, EDWIN D 2017.002
88-15-29-100-002 |MACKENZIE, CYNTHIA M 17017 $689.12 $1,300.00 $610.88[JOHNSON, LEAH 2017.029
88-13-11-330-008 |MALLATT, CHARLES S 17018 $713.30 $4,500.00 $3,786.70{417 LAND INVESTORS, LLC / WHITING, ERIK 2017.008
88-13-12-422-003 |MANES, JAMES ISSAC no bid $4,876.44 $0.00 $0.00

88-13-12-119-017 |MBAH, NDEM no bid $465.84 $0.00 $0.00

88-18-12-102-036 |MCCAULLEY, NOLAN K 17019 $5,324.97 $25,000.00] $19,675.03|ALDEN, EDWIN D 2017.002
88-13-10-107-005 |MCCORMACK, CRISSANDRA no bid $1,008.02 $0.00 $0.00

88-13-22-311-003 |MCELWAIN, CLARENCE 17020 $1,483.59 $3,800.00 $2,316.41|5&C GROUP LLC / NELSON, CINDY 2017.021
88-13-22-311-022 |MCELWAIN, CLARENCE E 17021 $577.60 $577.60 $0.00|5&C GROUP LLC / NELSON, CINDY 2017.021
88-13-14-412-007 |MEYERHARDT, BRIAN 17022 $2,828.75 $2,828.75 $0.00{SMITH, SCOTT W 2017.038
88-13-12-404-037 |MIDWEST LUSTRE CRAFT LTD 17023 $9,371.63 $18,100.00 $8,728.37|PREPS 2017 LLC / HODGES, ROBERTA 2017.010













































































































