
Properties Offered at 2015 Tax Sale

PARCEL NAME CERT TAX+COST SALE AMT SURPLUS BIDDER NAME #

88-13-12-321-002 AGLER, COLIN 15001 $3,038.77 $3,038.77 $0.00 SWEERE, ROBERT 19

88-13-01-114-014 ALLEN, ANITA K 15002 $1,923.19 $6,500.00 $4,576.81 SWEERE, ROBERT 19

88-13-14-236-006 AMY PROPERTIES LLC 15003 $4,322.04 $4,322.04 $0.00 N&B GROUP LLC, SONU BANSAL (AGENT) 39

88-13-12-406-017 ASSEMBLIES OF GOD FOUNDATION NO BID $711.38

88-13-14-413-004 BELTZ TRAILS END LLC 15004 $1,217.50 $1,217.50 $0.00 FIELDS, STERLING W III 31

88-07-25-301-021 BRINKMAN FARMS INC 15005 $1,022.60 $1,022.60 $0.00 JOHNSON, DAN 45

88-13-13-105-025 BROWN, TOM 15006 $2,323.60 $7,500.00 $5,176.40 SWEERE, ROBERT 19

88-13-28-204-019 BUMGARNER, JERRY L ETAL 15007 $379.61 $500.00 $120.39 WHALEY, TERRY 9

88-13-28-206-069 BUMGARNER, JERRY L ETAL 15008 $370.49 $775.00 $404.51 WHALEY, TERRY 9

88-13-21-129-016 BURCH, R V 15009 $482.92 $750.00 $267.08 N&B GROUP LLC, SONU BANSAL (AGENT) 39

88-13-15-402-003 CASTON, TRACY L ETAL 15010 $783.83 $783.83 $0.00 3 PALMS INVESTMENTS LLC, FRANKLIN J STOGSDILL (AGENT) 36

88-13-14-227-012 COMPTON, GUS J SR 15011 $1,258.54 $3,500.00 $2,241.46 JOHNSON, NIKOLAS 46

88-13-15-218-039 COMPTON, GUS SR 15012 $1,582.00 $1,582.00 $0.00 N&B GROUP LLC, SONU BANSAL (AGENT) 39

88-02-29-300-061 CORTESE, JOSEPH 15013 $696.10 $696.10 $0.00 JOHNSON, NIKOLAS 46

88-13-14-434-020 DECKARD, EDNA MAY ETAL 15014 $934.17 $1,025.00 $90.83 YOUNG, KAROLYN 10

88-13-21-405-034 DEVINE, JIM ETAL NO BID $813.69

88-13-35-322-006 DUNCAN, ALEXANDER C 15015 $2,096.17 $11,000.00 $8,903.83 GREEN, CHARLES C 1

88-12-18-212-012 FREMONT PHOENIX INC 15016 $1,409.83 $4,100.00 $2,690.17 LAKES LLC, KEVIN HALL (AGENT) 24

88-13-21-133-012 FUNK, JOHN E 15017 $1,504.02 $7,100.00 $5,595.98 NKA LLC, DAN NEWBERRY (AGENT) 35

88-17-16-100-353 GIBSON, CLETA R 15018 $1,036.28 $1,036.28 $0.00 CHRISTIANSON, RHONDA 12

88-17-02-200-044 GLEN CARTER EXCAVATING CO 15019 $7,402.20 $7,402.20 $0.00 FIELDS, STERLING W III 31

88-13-16-111-005 GREEN, JERALD D 15020 $924.11 $7,200.00 $6,275.89 NEWBERRY, AUGUST 34

88-13-23-142-006 HARRIS, DAVID K NO BID $958.60

88-11-04-115-034 HAYES, KARL K NO BID $338.97

88-12-07-310-057 HENDERSON, LULA B 15021 $2,120.45 $2,120.45 $0.00 WILLIAMS, STEVEN 16

88-04-22-100-006 HICKS, LEROY NO BID $2,863.54

88-13-28-201-040 HOPPIS, ARGIE;%DAVID COLE 15022 $263.77 $263.77 $0.00 YOUNG, KAROLYN 10

88-13-01-306-014 JAVATE, ROBERTO ORTIZ LUIS NO BID $482.92

88-13-22-406-014 KIMBALL, CARON SUE NO BID $990.25

88-13-16-210-029 KING, STUART H 15023 $766.38 $1,500.00 $733.62 WHITING, ERIK A 13

88-18-10-205-007 KING, STUART H NO BID $567.59

88-12-09-303-009 KRUSE, DAVID 15024 $1,734.28 $3,800.00 $2,065.72 WHITING, ERIK A 13

88-12-08-404-010 LANDRIGAN, CLINTON J ETAL 15025 $1,590.11 $5,000.00 $3,409.89 BOLTON, JASON W 32

88-13-23-418-043 LEWIS, CHARLES A NO BID $504.18

88-13-14-309-022 MBAH, NDEM NO BID $945.69

88-13-10-118-004 MCADAMS, BENNIE ONEIL NO BID $1,124.52

88-12-17-412-041 MCCAULLEY, NOLAN 15026 $3,444.14 $6,000.00 $2,555.86 SMITH, SCOTT 23

88-20-24-300-007 MCELROY HOMES LLC 15027 $6,804.45 $9,800.00 $2,995.55 LAKES LLC, KEVIN HALL (AGENT) 24

88-13-15-214-019 MEDLER, BONNIE NO BID $3,196.72

88-13-08-306-047 MOORE, LLOYD D 15028 $2,024.14 $4,000.00 $1,975.86 GREEN, CHARLES C 1

88-06-21-321-013 MORRISON, JAMES L 15029 $824.89 $1,500.00 $675.11 WILLIS, EMILY 2

88-13-17-302-001 NEWELL, ROGER 15030 $1,507.67 $1,507.67 $0.00 BUMGARNER, JUDITH 38

88-13-23-417-012 OGLESBY, MARILYN 15031 $1,036.54 $4,100.00 $3,063.46 N&B GROUP LLC, SONU BANSAL (AGENT) 39

88-13-12-302-010 OKEEFE, JOHN W JR NO BID $2,555.21

88-02-29-300-095 PAXSTON, AUSTON NO BID $847.12

88-13-14-210-011 PETERSEN, THEODORE M 15032 $1,287.39 $2,700.00 $1,412.61 FRANCIS, AMANDA 7
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88-13-10-411-006 PHILLIPS, WILLIAM J NO BID $1,844.09

88-18-24-308-014 PICKARD, BARBARA 15033 $5,815.95 $13,000.00 $7,184.05 BOLTON, JASON W 32

88-13-14-211-024 POKRINCHAK, DAVID 15034 $1,533.95 $8,200.00 $6,666.05 NKA LLC, DAN NEWBERRY (AGENT) 35

88-13-28-302-041 POPPENGA, DAVE NO BID $1,219.94

88-13-22-229-026 POPPENGA, DAVID 15035 $3,110.23 $8,000.00 $4,889.77 BOLTON, JASON W 32

88-01-29-300-094 PORTER, CARL L NO BID $750.43

88-13-12-111-019 POTTS, JAMES E NO BID $2,775.55

88-13-18-403-080 PRYOR, EVELYN NO BID $1,321.95

88-13-22-104-002 PRYOR, LARRY E 15036 $1,456.08 $1,456.08 $0.00 DAVIDSON, ZACHARY 30

88-13-23-418-032 ROBINSON, SHARON K NO BID $1,829.09

88-13-18-403-063 SCHULZ, TOMMIE L NO BID $2,314.56

88-12-32-305-007 SESSA, CHRIS A 15037 $1,558.09 $3,300.00 $1,741.91 JOHNSON, DAN 45

88-12-07-107-024 SHERRER, TINA NO BID $1,644.30

88-12-10-100-016 SIMPSON, HAROLD C 15038 $1,034.30 $1,100.00 $65.70 MUNCY, LESLIE 41

88-02-29-300-045 SMITH, SHANDA NO BID $725.06

88-01-20-400-002 SORRELL, PHILLIP 15039 $519.28 $800.00 $280.72 JOHNSON, DAN 45

88-01-20-400-194 SORRELL, PHILLIP 15040 $335.47 $1,000.00 $664.53 JOHNSON, DAN 45

88-13-08-201-044 SPRINGAIR INC NO BID $39,006.60

88-13-11-421-011 STORMENT, MICHELLE 15041 $1,600.00 $3,600.00 $2,000.00 TSCHERNY, DANIEL 28

88-13-21-202-082 STUBBS, FRED NO BID $9,030.43

88-13-14-319-024 SULLIVAN, FREDA I (GARRETT) 15042 $1,131.68 $5,200.00 $4,068.32 N&B GROUP LLC, SONU BANSAL (AGENT) 39

88-13-15-110-020 TANNEHILL, EDITH 15043 $863.50 $863.50 $0.00 BOLTON, JASON W 32

88-11-06-200-020 TARWATER, LINDA 15044 $766.11 $1,000.00 $233.89 LAKES LLC, KEVIN HALL (AGENT) 24

88-13-04-401-045 WALTERS, PATRICK NO BID $2,633.66

88-13-22-305-020 WEBSTER, JOHN 15045 $20,474.91 $20,474.91 $0.00 COLWELL, JENNIFER S 43

88-13-22-305-013 WHITE, BEULAH NO BID $1,847.74

88-13-11-126-024 WILLIAMS, ZELLA NO BID $1,338.97

88-13-11-329-022 WILLIAMSON SPOUSAL TRUST NO BID $640.90

88-13-12-115-001 WILSON, MICHAEL R 15046 $1,111.49 $3,700.00 $2,588.51 KH2 LLC, WILLIAM HOSMER (AGENT) 33

88-13-14-214-004 WILSON, RONNIE L NO BID $507.48

88-13-26-401-012 YONKMAN, RYAN J 15047 $994.77 $9,500.00 $8,505.23 KH2 LLC, WILLIAM HOSMER (AGENT) 33

88-13-16-111-098 ZUNIGA, MARTIN 15048 $1,917.03 $1,917.03 $0.00 VALKENBURG, LORELEI 22

Total $188,666.15 $196,454.73 $94,119.71
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