
Properties Offered at 2014 Tax Sale
PARCEL NAME CERT TAX+COST SALE AMT SURPLUS BIDDER NAME #

88-14-16-300-022 ACKERMAN, BRYAN C 14001 $1,752.29 $6,500.00 $4,747.71 LAWSON, JACQUELYN LEE 13

88-12-07-414-017 AMY PROPERTIES LLC 14002 $4,589.41 $4,589.41 $0.00 KH2 LLC / HOSMER, WILLIAM CRAIG/AGENT 38

88-13-14-236-006 AMY PROPERTIES LLC NO BID $2,630.80 - -

88-12-20-212-041 AMY PROPERTIES LLC 14003 $2,197.04 $3,000.00 $802.96 SUNSHINE INVESTMENTS SERVICES LLC / STOGSDILL, FRANKLIN J/AGENT 27

88-13-36-304-005 BARR-FLEMING, SONYA 14004 $1,856.61 $8,200.00 $6,343.39 S&C GROUP LLC / BANSAL, SONU/AGENT 36

88-13-14-215-001 BELL, JIMMIE NO BID $229.96 - -

88-13-28-206-069 BUMGARNER, JERRY L ETAL NO BID $193.88 - -

88-13-28-204-019 BUMGARNER, JERRY L ETAL NO BID $199.45 - -

88-13-15-107-011 CARROLL, MICHAEL 14005 $1,656.20 $1,656.20 $0.00 LAWSON, JACQUELYN LEE 13

88-19-30-200-067 CHAMBERS, JODY 14006 $9,997.98 $12,200.00 $2,202.02 FIELDS, STERLING W III 8

88-13-23-217-012 CHILTON, DENNIS 14007 $631.43 $631.43 $0.00 MONTGOMERY, OKSANA A 34

88-14-22-200-024 COBURN, JAMES A 14008 $1,934.84 $5,600.00 $3,665.16 S&C GROUP LLC / BANSAL, SONU/AGENT 36

88-13-14-417-027 COMBS, RAYMOND 14009 $1,181.73 $3,600.00 $2,418.27 BARNES, CHRISTOPHER JAMES 23

88-02-29-400-037 CRANE, MICHAEL T 14010 $846.77 $846.77 $0.00 LAMBERT, WENDEL RAY JR 25

88-02-29-400-045 DUDLEY, MELVIN D 14011 $1,659.61 $1,659.61 $0.00 LAMBERT, WENDEL RAY JR 25

88-19-05-413-019 FIELDER STINE ENTERPRISES INC NO BID $515.04 - -

88-12-26-200-077 FIELDS, ROBERT C 14012 $3,159.20 $5,500.00 $2,340.80 OVERHUE, TRENTON R 30

88-13-09-302-022 GARGES, DOUGLAS NO BID $730.63 - -

88-18-01-109-117 GCD COMPANY INC 14013 $538.97 $538.97 $0.00 WILLIAM C BEALL JR TR- BEALL, JONELL TRUSTEE 19

88-17-16-100-353 GIBSON, CLETA R NO BID $616.52 - -

88-17-02-200-044 GLEN CARTER EXCAVAING CO NO BID $5,298.62 - -

88-04-22-100-006 HICKS, LEROY NO BID $2,005.81 - -

88-13-15-413-006 HICKS, LESTER M 14014 $732.73 $732.73 $0.00 OVERHUE, TRENTON R 30

88-18-05-400-111 HILL, TERRY L 14015 $3,008.43 $10,500.00 $7,491.57 GBC INVESTMENTS LLC / CREED, GLORIA J/AGENT 21

88-13-36-210-029 HOLLEY, GOLDIE I 14016 $1,961.13 $10,200.00 $8,238.87 GBC INVESTMENTS LLC / CREED, GLORIA J/AGENT 21

88-08-12-400-006 HOWELL, SHARON 14017 $894.90 $894.90 $0.00 LAMBERT, WENDEL RAY JR 25

88-11-02-300-003 J ROG TRUST 14018 $214.43 $7,500.00 $7,285.57 BURNS, JOHN L 6

88-13-09-407-022 K&A LAND CO LLC NO BID $419.63 - -

88-13-11-408-009 KAMTEL INC NO BID $58,925.28 - -

88-18-01-108-004 KEYNOTE INV LLC 14019 $2,607.57 $6,500.00 $3,892.43 INFINITE OPPORTUNITIES LLC / HATHCOCK, DUSTIN RAY/AGENT 20

88-13-22-406-014 KIMBALL, CARON SUE NO BID $641.86 - -

88-13-14-312-005 KIMERY, ALFRED EDWARD NO BID $1,559.42 - -

88-18-10-205-007 KING, STUART H NO BID $375.09 - -

88-13-16-210-024 KING, STUART H 14020 $196.65 $196.65 $0.00 OVERHUE, TRENTON R 30

88-02-29-300-012 LAIRD, MELVIN R ETAL 14021 $2,969.81 $2,969.81 $0.00 JOHNSON, KARLA LENZ 4

88-12-21-212-024 LANGLOYS, E JEAN & WILLIAM F 14022 $1,470.09 $37,000.00 $35,529.91 GBC INVESTMENTS LLC / CREED, GLORIA J/AGENT 21

88-14-08-400-003 LENOUE, SHEILA KIM TRUST 14023 $3,547.46 $3,547.46 $0.00 OVERHUE, TRENTON R 30

88-13-23-418-043 LEWIS, CHARLES A NO BID $275.70 - $0.00

88-13-11-416-021 LIPSCOMB, JAKE 14024 $3,682.91 $3,682.91 $0.00 KH2 LLC / HOSMER, WILLIAM CRAIG/AGENT 38

88-13-21-134-028 LOCKARD, SUSAN M 14025 $690.99 $2,400.00 $1,709.01 NKA LLC / NEWBERRY, DAN/AGENT 17

88-13-03-208-003 LOVE, CHARLES R NO BID $287.11 - -

88-12-06-401-115 LOVELAND, JOHN R NO BID $797.55 - -

88-18-15-402-008 MAPLES, STILLMAN R 14026 $3,369.74 $16,000.00 $12,630.26 INFINITE OPPORTUNITIES LLC / HATHCOCK, DUSTIN RAY / SOLE MEMBER 20

88-13-14-309-022 MBAH, NDEM NO BID $635.85 - -

88-12-17-404-051 MCCAULLEY, NOLAN 14027 $4,000.74 $4,000.74 $0.00 KH2 LLC / HOSMER, WILLIAM CRAIG/AGENT 38

88-18-12-102-036 MCCAULLEY, NOLAN K 14028 $3,018.65 $3,600.00 $581.35 BURNS, JOHN L 6

88-13-11-318-002 MCNEAL, RICHARD NO BID $13,558.14 - -

88-13-15-214-019 MEDLER, BONNIE NO BID $2,062.54 - -

88-13-19-401-086 MORELOCK-ROSS PROP INC NO BID $811.34 - -

88-13-21-112-005 MOSS, EDDY 14029 $1,053.54 $1,053.54 $0.00 SISCHO, STEVEN R 1

88-13-15-216-001 MURPHY, PATRICK J 14030 $1,083.23 $1,083.23 $0.00 NKA LLC / NEWBERRY, DAN/AGENT 17

88-13-12-302-010 OKEEFE, JOHN W JR NO BID $1,603.12 - -

88-02-29-300-095 PAXTON, AUSTON NO BID $490.66 - -
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88-13-15-212-006 PAYNE, DONA G 14031 $1,490.06 $6,000.00 $4,509.94 ABSOLUTE HORIZON LLC / LESSMEIER, JASON J 22

88-07-04-400-017 PECK, WILLIAM LEE 14032 $804.91 $804.91 $0.00 LAMBERT, WENDEL R JR 25

88-13-22-223-043 PHELPS, EARL 14033 $961.43 $1,000.00 $38.57 S&C GROUP LLC / BANSAL, SONU/AGENT 36

88-13-10-411-006 PHILLIPS, WILLIAM J NO BID $1,118.02 - -

88-13-28-302-041 POPPENGA, DAVE NO BID $869.96 - -

88-13-22-229-026 POPPENGA, DAVID NO BID $2,313.60 - -

88-13-12-111-019 POTTS, JAMES E NO BID $1,643.24 - -

88-13-18-403-080 PRYOR, EVELYN NO BID $785.55 - -

88-13-11-413-011 RAINEY, ARTHUR ETAL 14034 $1,275.23 $3,100.00 $1,824.77 S&C GROUP LLC / BANSAL, SONU/AGENT 36

88-13-12-221-014 RAINEY, MICHAEL L 14035 $1,177.98 $1,300.00 $122.02 NEWBERRY, AUGUST J 18

88-13-34-401-029 REEB, ALONZO EARL JR TRUST 14036 $3,451.72 $10,000.00 $6,548.28 NKA LLC / NEWBERRY, DAN/AGENT 17

88-13-22-116-030 REGIER, HENRY 14037 $1,284.10 $7,000.00 $5,715.90 SISCHO, STEVEN R 1

88-07-21-300-004 RHODES, EUGENE 14038 $860.50 $1,500.00 $639.50 DAWSON, MELISSA L 14

88-17-01-100-097 RLB PROPERTIES LLC 14039 $6,792.24 $6,792.24 $0.00 KH2 LLC / HOSMER, WILLIAM CRAIG/AGENT 38

88-17-01-200-099 RLB PROPERTIES LLC 14040 $21,191.23 $21,191.23 $0.00 KH2 LLC / HOSMER, WILLIAM CRAIG/AGENT 38

88-12-28-109-019 ROACHE, BRIAN C TRUST NO BID $435.81 - -

88-12-28-109-018 ROACHE, BRIAN C TRUST NO BID $418.13 - -

88-13-12-306-010 ROMERO, MICHAEL A NO BID $692.88 - -

88-12-18-205-008 RYMEL, APRIL 14041 $2,784.25 $2,784.25 $0.00 S&C GROUP LLC / BANSAL, SONU/AGENT 36

88-12-10-100-016 SIMPSON, HAROLD C NO BID $607.65 - -

88-01-20-400-190 SORRELL, PHILL 14042 $209.42 $209.42 $0.00 LAMBERT, WENDEL RAY JR 25

88-01-20-400-002 SORRELL, PHILLIP 14043 $322.88 VOID VOID VOID

88-01-20-400-194 SORRELL, PHILLIP 14044 $172.27 VOID VOID VOID

88-01-20-400-054 SORRELL, PHILLIP E 14045 $191.61 $191.61 $0.00 LAMBERT, WENDEL RAY JR 25

88-12-06-401-061 SPEAR, ELSIE LEVORA NO BID $797.55 - -

88-13-08-201-044 SPRINGAIR INC NO BID $27,094.53 - -

88-13-14-420-009 STARKS, JOHNNY C 14046 $1,825.73 $3,800.00 $1,974.27 S&C GROUP LLC / BANSAL, SONU/AGENT 36

88-13-10-107-030 STEWART, LANCE P 14047 $1,273.00 $4,100.00 $2,827.00 BARNES, CHRISTOPHER JAMES 23

88-13-14-220-002 STONECREST INCOME & OPP FUND I 14048 $1,167.23 $1,167.23 $0.00 S&C GROUP LLC / BANSAL, SONU/AGENT 36

88-13-26-104-029 THOMAS, MATTHEW D 14049 $2,136.10 $7,000.00 $4,863.90 SWEERE, ROBERT MICHAEL 15

88-12-05-217-024 THOMPSON, PATSY A 14050 $2,192.06 $15,500.00 $13,307.94 GBC INVESTMENTS LLC / CREED, GLORIA J/AGENT 21

88-13-11-421-006 TOMPKINS, BRENDA M 14051 $8,260.61 $8,260.61 $0.00 S&C GROUP LLC / BANSAL, SONU/AGENT 36

88-13-11-422-012 TRUITT, JAMES 14052 $539.29 $539.29 $0.00 SUNSHINE INVESTMENTS SERVICES LLC / STOGSDILL, FRANKLIN J/AGENT 27

88-13-14-130-026 TRUITT, JAMES E NO BID $1,477.02 - -

88-13-11-329-003 TRUITT, JAMES E NO BID $924.14 - -

88-13-21-405-008 TRUITT, JAMES E NO BID $457.21 - -

88-13-14-417-001 TRUITT, JAMES E NO BID $564.89 - -

88-13-23-216-026 TRUITT, JAMES E NO BID $533.42 - -

88-13-10-301-008 TRUITT, JAMES E NO BID $487.21 - -

88-13-14-234-019 VAUGHAN, MELINDA LOU 14053 $3,147.48 $3,147.48 $0.00 HADEN, ROBERT L 16

88-13-04-401-045 WALTERS, PATRICK NO BID $1,885.92 - -

88-13-22-305-013 WHITE, BEULAH NO BID $978.61 - -

88-13-21-134-012 WILSON, MARGARET TRUST 14054 $1,947.54 $1,947.54 $0.00 CITY OF SPRINGFIELD / MCDONALD, DUKE/ASSISTANT CITY ATTORNEY 32

88-13-15-223-035 ZUNIGA, MARTIN 14055 $2,257.81 $4,200.00 $1,942.19 TSCHERNY, DANIEL BRIAN 7

88-13-16-111-098 ZUNIGA, MARTIN NO BID $1,194.22 - -

88-13-22-305-020 ZUNIGA, MARTIN ETAL NO BID $14,200.31 - -

$288,565.63 $277,920.17 $144,193.56
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